
wish you to understand that the Lord has 
pleased to organize tabernacles here, and 
put spirits into them, and they then be-
come intelligent beings. By and by, sooner 
or later, the body, this that is tangible to 
you, that you can feel, see, handle, etc., re-
turns to its mother dust. Is the spirit dead? 
No. You believe the spirit still exists, when 
this body has crumbled to the earth again, 
and the spirit that God puts into the taber-
nacle goes into the world of spirits. What 
is their situation? Is there any opportunity 
for them whatever? Yes, there is; although 
there is a great deal of Scripture which the 
priests have been pleased to make, with-
out revelation, that contradicts this idea; 
and the traditions of the fathers contradict 
it, not the traditions of the Prophets and 
Apostles, but of our fathers, those who 
have lived in the dark ages of the world, 
and the great majority of those who live 
now; for I do not know of a darker period 
in the history of the world, than that of the 
nineteenth century, apart from the light of 
the new and everlasting covenant. It is the 
ignorance and superstition of the people 
that contradict future progression in the 
world of spirits, for the Gospel does not. 
There is an opportunity for men who are 
in the spirit to receive the Gospel. Jesus, 
while his body lay in the grave two nights 
and one day, went to the world of spirits to 
show the brethren how they should build 
up the kingdom, and bring spirits to the 
knowledge of the truth in the spirit world; 
he went to set them the pattern there, as 
he had done on this earth. Hence you per-
ceive that there, spirits have the privilege of 
embracing the truth.

You may ask if they are baptized there? 
No. Can they have hands laid upon them 
for the gift of the Holy Ghost? No. None 
of the outward ordinances that pertain to 
the flesh are administered there, but the

light, glory, and power of the Holy Ghost 
are enjoyed just as freely as upon this 
earth; and there are laws which govern and 
control the spirit world, and to which they 
are subject.

Can we do anything for them? Yes. 
What are we trying to build a Temple for? 
And we shall not only build a Temple here, 
if we are successful, and are blessed and pre-
served, but we shall probably commence 
two or three more, and so on as fast as the 
work requires, for the express purpose of 
redeeming our dead. When I get a revela-
tion that some of my progenitors lived and 
died without the blessings of the Gospel, or 
even hearing it preached, but were as hon-
est as I am, as upright as I am, or as any 
man or woman could be upon the earth; as 
righteous, so far as they knew how, as any 
Apostle or Prophet that ever lived, I will go 
and be baptized, confirmed, washed, and 
anointed, and go through all the ordinances 
and endowments for them, that their way 
may be open to the celestial kingdom.

As I have frequently told you, that is the 
work of the Millennium. It is the work that 
has to be performed by the seed of Abra-
ham, the chosen seed, the royal seed, the 
blessed of the Lord, those the Lord made 
covenants with. They will step forth, and 
save every son and daughter of Adam who 
will receive salvation here on the earth; and 
all spirits in the spirit world will be preached 
to, conversed with, and the principles of sal-
vation carried to them, that they may have 
the privilege of receiving the Gospel; and 
they will have plenty of children here on the 
earth to officiate for them in those ordinan
ces of the Gospel that pertain to the flesh.

Many people believe that the Spirit of the 
Lord has not been upon the earth when the 
Gospel was not among men in its purity; 
they believe the Spirit of the Lord has been 
entirely taken from the earth since the apos-
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