
man, that the mind being filled with un-
derstanding, light, knowledge, truth, the-
ory, and with a knowledge of things God 
has revealed, may be able to communicate 
at the very moment that part or portion 
of the same which God shall be pleased to 
impart to the congregation, suited to their 
capacity and circumstances; this is not 
taking thought beforehand what we shall 
say. If we should treasure up the words 
that God has revealed—that are written in 
the Book of Mormon, Doctrine and Cov-
enants, and in the various revelations that 
God has given in latter times (I mean the 
printed and written ones), together with 
what he has revealed in ancient times; if 
we should get it all imprinted upon the 
tablet of our minds, it would not be taking 
thought beforehand what we should say.

When we arise to speak before a congre-
gation, if we place our dependence upon 
God to inspire us with the Holy Spirit, to 
bring forth not only the knowledge and in-
formation in regard to things that are writ-
ten, and things that have been revealed, 
but to communicate new ideas, instruc-
tions, and information by the power of the 
Holy Ghost, we shall thus be able to edify.

Sometimes when I arise before a con-
gregation of the Saints, here in the Valleys 
of the Mountains, I look at myself natu-
rally, and think over naturally in my own 
mind, How can I edify this people? What 
can I say to them that has not already been 
said? This is a weakness in human nature. 
These meditations and reflections ought 
not to have any bearing upon the mind; 
God has wisdom sufficient; He has knowl-
edge sufficient, and understanding, and 
light, and truth to communicate some-
thing for the benefit of the people, though 
they may have been instructed for a  
long period, and been well informed  
in doctrine and principles.  Some-

times the Lord does not see proper to im-
part any new ideas to the speaker, but rath-
er to influence his mind to dwell upon old 
things, or in other words, that which has 
already been made manifest, for the pur-
pose of communicating more clearly, or 
impressing upon the mind more forcibly, 
the importance of attending to that which 
has already been spoken and revealed.

We are only sojourners here, stopping 
here for a short period of time, and while 
we are here we often meet together. What 
for? To learn something that is calculated 
to benefit us temporally or spiritually. In-
deed everything with which we are sur-
rounded, every circumstance that we may 
be placed in, everything with which we 
have to do, if properly used, is calculated 
to benefit the mind of man. That is the ob-
ject of all the works of God, to benefit liv-
ing beings—beings that are capable of be-
ing made happy—capable of receiving joy 
and peace, all His works from the begin-
ning to the end (if there be any beginning 
or end, which we doubt very much), are 
calculated in their nature to render happy, 
living, intelligent beings. That is the rea-
son we are here—the reason we have come 
from distant countries, from foreign lands, 
and congregated in these valleys; it is in 
order that we may be more happy, and 
more fitted to gain that experience that is 
calculated to make us more happy. We are 
looking forward to a time when we shall 
be exceedingly happy; that is natural to 
the mind of man; it is on the stretch look-
ing forward to the period when it shall be  
far more happy than at present. We are  
inquiring how, and by what means, or  
by what course of conduct, we can make 
ourselves more happy than at the pres-
ent time. Some people pursue one course  
and some another; mankind have their  
various paths, walks, and courses, there
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