
up with us, to make Saints of us? We are as 
yet obliged to have devils in our commu-
nity, we could not build up the kingdom 
without them. Many of you know that 
you cannot get your endowment without 
the Devil being present; indeed we cannot 
make rapid progress without the devils. I 
know that it frightens the righteous sectar-
ian world to think that we have so many 
devils with us, so many poor, miserable 
curses. Bless your souls, we could not pros-
per in the kingdom of God without them. 
We must have those amongst us who will 
steal our fence poles, who will go and steal 
hay from their neighbor’s haystack, or go 
into his cornfield to steal corn, and leave 
the fence down; nearly every ax that is 
dropped in the canyon must be picked up 
by them, and the scores of lost watches, 
gold rings, breast pins, etc., must get into 
their hands, though they will not wear 
them in your sight. It is essentially neces-
sary to have such characters here.

After we had given the brethren such a 
scouring two or three months ago, about 
returning lost property when found, 
one or two men brought in two or three 
rusty nails of no value, which they had 
picked up; this was tantamount to say-
ing to brother Sprague, “If we had found 
your purse, or if we had found Brigham’s 
purse, we would see you in hell before we 
would return it.” We wish to impress upon  
you the necessity of your bringing the ax 
you find, the hay fork, or any other lost 
property which you find, to the person who 
is appointed to take charge of such prop-
erty, that the owners may again possess it. 
But if you should pick up a piece of rotten 
wood, and bring it to brother Brigham, 
or Dr. Sprague, with a show of honesty, 
and in derision of the counsel you have 
received, it would be like saying, “If we 
could find or steal your purses, you should

never see them again. We are poor, miser-
able devils, and mean to live here by steal-
ing from the Saints, and you cannot help 
yourselves.”

Live here then, you poor, miserable 
curses, until the time of retribution, when 
your heads will have to be severed from 
your bodies. Just let the Lord Almighty 
say, “Lay judgment to the line, and righ-
teousness to the plummet,” and the time 
of thieves is short in this community. 
What do you suppose they would say in 
old Massachusetts, should they hear that 
the Latter-day Saints had received a rev-
elation or commandment to lay “judg-
ment to the line, and righteousness to the 
plummet?” What would they say in old 
Connecticut? They would raise a univer-
sal howl of, “How wicked those Mormons 
are; they are killing the evildoers who are 
among them; why I hear that they kill the 
wicked away up yonder in Utah.” They do 
not kill anybody down there, do they?

As for the inhabitants of the earth, who 
know anything about the “Mormons,” hav-
ing power to utter worse epithets against us 
than they do, they have to get more knowl-
edge in order to do it; and as for those en-
emies who have been in our midst, feeling 
any worse than they do, they have first to 
know more; they are as full of bad feeling 
now as they can hold without bursting. 
What do I care for the wrath of man? No 
more than I do for the chickens that run in 
my dooryard. I am here to teach the ways of 
the Lord, and lead men to life everlasting, 
but if they have not a mind to go there, I 
wish them to keep out of my path.

I want the Elders of Israel to understand 
that if they are exposed in their stealing, 
lying, deceiving, wickedness, and cov- 
etousness, which is idolatry, they must not 
fly in a passion about it, for we calculate  
to expose you, from time to time, as we
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