
ities of the Church to the Conference this 
morning, though such has not been our 
general practice. I believe the brethren are 
pretty much in readiness, and have all got 
their guns ready for shooting. We will first 
attend to the business, so that if it is neces-
sary to repair to the canyons we can do so.

I do not know how long we shall hold 
this Conference, and therefore no one 
needs to ask me. There is a time for all 
things; and I never saw a better time than 
now to secure potatoes and other crops, 
and thus do our preaching in the season 
thereof and digging potatoes in the season 
thereof. And I could almost wish that our 
Conference would be dismissed this morn-
ing, and all hands go and secure the pota-
toes, squashes, corn, etc.

We have heretofore spent a great deal 
of time in Conferences unmolested, and 
we shall again have a great deal of time to 
spend in this capacity undisturbed. We 
must have what is good for us—that which 
puts us in mind and brings to us principles 
that are free. Should we live in peace, year 
after year, how long would it be before we 
were glued to the world? Our affections 
would be so fastened to the things of the 
world that it would be hard for us to spend 
a little time in Conference; it would be 
hard to go on missions; it would be con-
trary to our feelings to attend to anything 
but our own individual concerns to make 
ourselves rich.

It seems to be necessary for the Lord 
to bring this people into circumstances to 
show them that the things of this world are 
mere nothingness in their present state—are 
but a shadow. They are today, and tomor-
row they are not. This shows to us that all 
things pertaining to this world are subject to 
change, and such changes as we cannot con-
trol. We find that kings are raised up and 
emperors placed in power, and then they are

hurled down. We see men who are popular, 
wealthy, and rich become poor. History and 
our own experience prove all this, and that 
riches take the wings of the morning and fly 
away. Today we are rich—tomorrow we are 
poor. Next week we may be rich, and the 
week after poor again. It is the Lord that 
gives and the Lord that takes away; and it is 
a blessing that we have the privilege of this 
experience in our present condition.

Look at ourselves—run over our own 
experience, and we shall discover that 
ourselves, our neighbors, our friends, our 
acquaintances, and all people do not al-
ways know when they are happy. In other 
words, if you could crowd an individual or 
a community into heaven without experi-
ence, it would be no enjoyment to them. 
They must know the opposite: they must 
know how to contrast, in order to prize 
and appreciate the comfort and happiness, 
the joy and the bliss they are actually in 
possession of. Can you realize this? How 
many there are who will exclaim, “If I had 
but known it, I was happy in such a situ-
ation! How happy I might have been, if I 
had only known that I was happy.”

You will see individuals who are easy 
and comfortable, that would like to change 
their situations; and when they change, 
they find that they have changed for the 
worse. They then turn round and say, 
“How happy I could have been, if I had 
known how to appreciate my own happi-
ness! I had nothing to annoy me; I was in 
comfortable circumstances; I enjoyed good 
health, and had all that I could ask for to 
make life desirable; but I did not know at 
the time that I enjoyed one of the comforts 
of life.”

Is that the experience of any of you? I 
know that it is of a great many of you. Then 
learn to be happy when you have the privi-
lege. For many years we have had the privilege
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