
out of the heavens, or by the voice of my 
servants, it is the same.” Again, concerning 
his servants—“Whatsoever you shall speak 
by my Spirit shall be scripture—shall be 
the word of the Lord, the will of the Lord, 
the mind of the Lord, and the power of 
God unto salvation.” Again, from the New 
Testament, Jesus says, “Whosoever heareth 
you (whom I send) heareth me.” You men 
of business do not empower and send an 
agent to transact business for you unless 
you intend to honor his words and his do-
ings. The law will compel you to do this. 
The God of heaven does not send forth his 
servants upon the earth but with the fixed 
purpose to honor their words when they 
abide in the instructions given them.

I will now pave the way for my political 
manifest. Jesus says, “Whosoever falleth 
upon this stone shall be broken.” What 
stone does he refer to? The Lord says to 
his disciples, “Whom say ye that I am?” 
Peter answers—“Thou art the Christ, the 
Son of the living God.” Jesus indicated 
to Peter that he had spoken truly by say-
ing unto him, “Blessed art thou, Simon 
Barjona: flesh and blood hath not revealed 
this unto thee, but my Father which is in 
heaven. And I say unto thee, That thou art 
Peter, and upon this rock will I build my 
church; and the gates of hell shall not pre-
vail against it.” This stone or rock was the 
word of God revealed unto Peter. Present 
revelation from God, then, is the stone 
or rock which our Savior spoke of. Any 
church or any people built upon this foun-
dation cannot be prevailed against by any 
power, for one obvious reason: whenever 
a people are built upon this foundation 
and they get into trouble and difficulty, 
they will ask the Lord to show them the 
way out; and being built upon present  
revelation and in communion with  
God, he will tell them what to do. His

wisdom is greater than the cunning of the 
Devil, and consequently the gates of hell 
cannot prevail against them. Any people 
built upon this foundation are hard to 
head, though their numbers may be small. 
The ancient church was never overcome 
until they lost this principle of present rev-
elation. Then they were prevailed against 
and fell away, because they ceased to build 
upon this foundation—the stone or rock of 
present revelation. Solomon says—“Where 
no vision is, the people perish.”

Many churches are built up in the 
world, professedly, unto the name of 
Christ. But have they present revelation? 
No, they have not. They despise the idea 
of present revelation, and kill the Prophets 
that give them, and persecute the people 
that believe them. Will the gates of hell 
prevail against such? To whom will our 
Savior say—“Depart from me, ye workers 
of iniquity; I know you not?” Will it not be 
to those who are not built upon this rock? 
Now for politics.

To send the army to Utah was the mea-
sure and policy of a Democratic adminis-
tration of the United States Government. 
This Democratic administration was the 
only legitimate power that could send it 
here. It was the official channel through 
which the flood was poured in upon us. 
Merchants, gamblers, whoremasters, 
thieves, murderers, false writers, drunk-
ards, and, to cap the climax, a drunken, de-
bauched judiciary, with plenty of bayonets 
to enforce their decrees. Some decent men 
came, most likely; yet I know not one with 
whom I could safely trust the virtue of any 
female in their power. They came to gratify 
their basest passions; and they will leave, 
if they leave at all, with the wrath of God 
upon them, candidates for damnation. 
They have burned strange fire upon the
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