
not wish to confine myself, to say all that 
my mind would be led to say on the sub-
ject. I can say at once, If Jesus had taken 
the kingdom in the days when he was upon 
the earth, he would have spoiled the whole 
plan—he would have ruined the object for 
which he came into the world. If he had 
established his kingdom directly after the 
flood and reigned triumphantly on the 
earth, the earth could never have answered 
the ends of its creation—the inhabitants of 
the earth could not have been accountable. 
If he had to take possession of the earth at 
this present time, he would ruin his own 
scheme—thwart his own plans. It may be 
a mystery—it is with the many—why the 
Lord permits this and that, and dictates 
thus and so. This is for want of intelligence 
in the intelligent beings that are upon the 
earth. If they understood the object of the 
creation of this earth and the inhabitants 
upon it, these matters would be an easy and 
pleasing theme to their understandings; 
they would become natural principles to 
them, easy to be understood. They would 
comprehend the design of the Almighty in 
the formation of these intelligent beings, in 
the direction of them, the object of the cre-
ation of the earth, and the final issue in the 
end, when all that has been designed of this 
earth and all consigned to this earth have 
come upon it, and the work is completed—
the winding-up scene has come, when Jesus 
shall have finished his work pertaining to 
man and his agency—you will then see that 
the kingdom will be taken possession of, 
and that very quickly.

Every mortal being must stand up as an 
intelligent, organized capacity, and choose 
or refuse the good, and thus act for him-
self. All must have that opportunity, no 
matter if all go into the depths of wicked- 
ness. Whether they sustain the kingdom of

God and promote the Gospel of salvation, 
or not, the earth must remain in the hands 
of men, liable to be acted upon continually 
by a superior power and authority. Man’s 
independence must be held inviolate; it 
must be reserved to each and every indi-
vidual: all must have the privilege of acting 
upon it. Until the last spirit that has been 
designed to come here and take a taberna-
cle has come upon the earth, the winding-
up scene cannot come; I have not time to 
say what I would like to upon this subject, 
but will leave it to your own reflection.

Marvel not that the kingdom of God is 
not in its fulness. Marvel not that you see 
every man and woman subject to the pas-
sions that belong to fallen nature. There 
never was a Prophet on the earth but what 
was subject to passions, as we are. Every 
son and daughter of Adam that has come 
into this world has been subject to sin, and 
prone to wander. They must have their 
times and seasons; and when the day has 
come in which all things are to be gathered 
in one, the Lord will gather those things. 
When the day comes in which Jesus will 
take possession of the earth (he will take 
possession of it when the time comes that 
Satan will be ejected from the inheritance 
of the children—of the legal heirs), you 
will find that ejectment will be served, 
and it will be effectual. It will be effectual 
upon every tenant or occupant upon the 
premises of the Almighty, and they will 
be forthwith removed. But the time is not 
yet come—the work is not yet finished. Be 
patient—be coworkers with our Savior and 
Master until this work is accomplished, 
and we shall be blessed in our deeds.

I wish to make a few remarks to  
the brethren in this  city in regard 
to reaching forth their  hands and  
means to assist in gathering the poor
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