
are the coverlids, the bonnets, and many 
other necessary articles that can be made at 
home just as well as not. You can see ladies 
with the nearest kind of bonnets on of their 
own make; and if they want a new bonnet 
for the baby, they know how to make it. 
There are their undergarments, worn by 
the people here generally; they are made of 
wool, and that is produced here. What a 
blessing it is to be able to supply ourselves 
with so many of the necessaries and com-
forts of life here in these mountains! Some 
of you have got an idea that wool will not 
do; but let me inform you that when Peter 
came and sat in the Temple in Kirtland, 
he had on a neat woolen garment, nicely 
adjusted round the neck. What do sheep 
wear next the skin? Wool, of course. What 
do goats wear? Hair, for that is their na-
ture. These are facts that are apparent to all 
who will look.

To return to the subject of the garments 
of the Holy Priesthood, I will say that the 
one which Jesus had on when he appeared 
to the Prophet Joseph was neat and clean, 
and Peter had on the same kind, and he 
also had a key in his hand. John also came 
and administered unto Joseph Smith, and 
remember that Peter, James, and John hold 
the keys pertaining to their dispensation 
and pertaining to this, and they came and 
conferred their Priesthood and authority 
upon Joseph the Seer, which is for the 
gathering together of all who seek the way 
of life. What is there that we cannot make 
within ourselves? There are but few things. 
If we have a desire to be released from 
bondage and oppression, we shall labor  
to produce what we need. I intend to 
have cloth, that has been made here,

from head to foot. What are we going to 
do? A great many may say that they always 
wish to have their carding, spinning, and 
weaving done so as to be ready for the win-
ter, and be at liberty to go to the parties. 
That is very good. But there is one other 
matter I wish to speak of in this connec-
tion, and that is that President Young 
wants this people to bring up some card-
ing machines from the States, so that we 
can go forward and be in a short time per-
fectly independent of the world. This is the 
course for you and I to take; and, also, to 
lay aside our vanity and foolishness, and 
that which destroys the body. I have ob-
served a great deal of the follies of people 
in my experience. If we will do right, our 
children will be a great deal stronger than 
we are in body, limb, joint, and muscles, 
for many of us have been weakened by fol-
ly, just as the present generation of young 
people are ruining themselves with their 
foolish fashions.

I have often had my feelings hurt when 
I have seen men grunt and grumble at ev-
ery little trial, and then to see their wives, 
and many in fact that are not wives, mur-
mur and find fault with their circumstan
ces. It is true that some are doing all they 
can for the good of the community, but it 
is not so with all. Let us all labor and strive 
the best we can to build up the kingdom of 
our God here on the earth.

May God Almighty bless you, my 
brethren and sisters, may the blessing of 
peace be with you that you may enjoy the 
good Spirit, a spirit of integrity and faith-
fulness, and may that Spirit rest upon all 
the Saints in the mountains and through-
out the world, is my prayer. Amen.
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