
mixed; while the bread is baking the tea is
spoiling, the meat and potatoes are getting
cold and unfit to eat; when the bread is
ready, as likely as not the fruit is forgotten,
and a great effort has to be made to prepare
the fruit; much bustle, confusion, labor,
and time have been expended to get the
food ready, and when it is served up the tea
is not worth drinking, the potatoes are
tough, watery, and cold, the meat is dry,
hard, and unpalatable, the biscuits are
baked too much on the outside and not
enough in the inside, while the fruit is only
half-cooked; and taking it altogether, it
would be better for the stomach to reject
such a meal of victuals, if there existed a
prospect of dining upon a more wholesome
and better prepared meal at noon.

We have been gathered together in these
valleys to be taught. We must first learn to
control ourselves before we can think to
control our fellow creatures. The Lord has
given extensive lines of operation to both
Saint and sinner, but when he gathers his
family he expects them to first master these
so-called little things; he wishes us to learn
to live with each other, and to surround
ourselves with all the common necessaries
and comforts of life. Until this is done we
are unprepared to receive the greater bless-
ings, for if we had them now we should
not know what to do with them. It is our
business to live, to learn how to preserve
our lives, and labor to make the earth into
a Garden of Eden; unless we do this, we are
unworthy to possess eternal life. “And he
said unto him, Well, thou good servant,
because thou hast been faithful in a very
little, have thou authority over ten cities.”
He that is not faithful in the things of this
world, who will commit unto him the
things which pertain to eternity?

All things belong to the Lord, and

we belong to the Lord, and if we are faith-
ful until we have passed the ordeal and
proved ourselves worthy before the heavens
to receive our crowns, then we shall receive
a deed of that which the Lord gives to us.
Until then, that which we hold we hold
only as stewards for the Lord. It is our priv-
ilege to grow and increase continually, to
receive knowledge upon knowledge, and
prepare to enter upon the higher duties of
eternal life. We thus proceed from one step
to another until we merge into immortal-
ity. We do not become another kind of be-
ings in passing through the resurrection,
but we are more refined through the appli-
cation of the laws of the Gospel to our lives
and passing through the grave. The grave
will take away every deformity from the
mortal organisms of the faithful, and they
will be perfect as our Father in heaven is
perfect.

We have now space to prove ourselves
worthy to receive the glory that God has in
store for the faithful, but we have to learn
the little things first. We are brought here
expressly, in the first place, to raise potatoes,
grain, fruit, wool, flax, and every other nec-
essary and mortal comfort we can produce
in this climate. Some of our Elders will
preach until they preach the people blind,
and will die in their ignorance and go to
hell, unless they learn what their lives are
worth and how to preserve them. I am
speaking to the Saints. If we do not learn
what God has brought us here for, and the
nature of the mission he has given us, we
may preach the Bible until we are blind and
old as Methuselah, and die and be damned
at last. It is our duty to learn how to govern
ourselves, and how to conduct ourselves
pleasingly in the sight of heaven towards
our friends, families, and neighbors, build-
ing up cities and towns, opening farms,
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