
food, besides bread, to supply that variety 
of diet, which, in a great measure through 
our traditions, our nature craves. If it is to 
build cities and temples or to do the other 
labors which belong to the building up of 
the Kingdom of God, be it so; all this is 
right, everything in its time and season.

Brother Taylor has given us a very cor-
rect history and statement, with regard to 
the line of demarcation between the savage 
and the civilized. Civilization is simply the 
spirit of improvement, in learning and civil 
manners. The world may be said to have 
advanced in this so far as the arts and sci-
ences are concerned; but, with these, they 
have mingled wicked ideas and practices, 
of which the heathen and barbarian would 
be ashamed, and of which they are entirely 
ignorant. We now live in the midst of the 
latter; they do not believe in making any 
improvements that will better their con-
dition in the least. Their forefathers were 
once enlightened, and their knowledge was 
in advance of the knowledge of the pres-
ent age. These natives belong to the house 
of Israel, and are embraced in the promises 
and covenants made to Abraham, Isaac, 
and Jacob; but through their forefathers 
transgressing the law of God, and breaking 
their covenants made with God, he hid his 
face from them, and they were left alone 
to follow the devices of their own evil 
hearts, until the whole race has sunk deep 
into barbarism. It is written in the Book 
of Mormon: “And because of their cursing 
which was upon them they did become an 
idle people, full of mischief and subtlety, 
and did seek in the wilderness for beasts of 
prey.” The Lord has taken from this race 
any disposition for improvement even to 
this day; the best of them consider it a dis-
grace to work. Whatever drudgery is per-

formed is done by their squaws, or by 
slaves captured from neighboring tribes 
or bands. Ask any of them to work; the 
reply is, “me big Indian, me no work.” 
This is their idea touching greatness. 
But their ancient Prophets have spoken 
good concerning them. It is prophesied 
by Nephi as follows: “For after the book 
[Book of Mormon] of which I have spo-
ken shall come forth, and be written unto 
the Gentiles, and sealed up again unto 
the Lord, there shall be many which shall 
believe the words which are written; and 
they shall carry them forth unto the rem-
nant of our seed [the present American 
Indians.] And then shall the remnant of 
our seed know concerning us, how that we 
came out from Jerusalem, and that they are 
descendants of the Jews. And the Gospel 
of Jesus Christ shall be declared among 
them; wherefore, they shall be restored to 
the knowledge of their fathers, and also to 
the knowledge of Jesus Christ, which was 
had among their fathers. And then shall 
they rejoice; for they shall know that it is a 
blessing unto them from the hand of God; 
and their scales of darkness shall begin to 
fall from their eyes; and many generations 
shall not pass away among them, save they 
shall be a white and delightsome people.” 
The laboring man, the ingenious, industri-
ous, and prudent man, the man who lays 
himself out to advance the human family 
in every saving principle for happiness, for 
beauty, and excellency, for wisdom, power, 
greatness, and glory is the true benefactor 
of his race; he is the gentleman, the hon-
orable, high-minded citizen of the world, 
and is worthy the society and admiration 
of the great and wise among all nations, 
though he may be destitute of wealth and 
title; he is a civilized man.
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