
We are. I have said, and say today, that ac-
cording to the age of the people we have
improved as fast as the church of Enoch. I
trust we improve faster, for we have not as
much time as they had. In some of the first
revelations which were given to this
Church the order of Enoch was given for a
pattern to this people; and Enoch pat-
terned after the heavens. The object of the
School of the Prophets is to train ourselves
until we can receive the order of Enoch in
all its fullness. In the commencement of
this Church the Latter-day Saints could
not receive it, and they were driven from
city to city, as the Lord said they should be
through the mouth of His servant Joseph,
until they should be willing to receive this
order.

There is no evil in doing good, no wrong
in doing right. It is the evil that people do
which renders them obnoxious to the heav-
ens, hateful to each other, and unworthy of
their being upon the earth. Let the people
be righteous, full of love, faith and good
works, loving and serving God with all their
hearts, and they are happy, and they strive to
make everybody around them happy. From
henceforth the wicked will become more
wicked, and their wickedness will be made
more manifest, and the corruptions which
now lurk in darkness will stalk abroad, 
and confidence and safety will vanish

from among men, until the good-meaning
people among all nations will be willing to
flee to any place to find peace and safety.
Let us be obedient to the Man we serve.
We believe in a one Man power, and that
Man is God our Father, who lives in the
Heavens. In being united with Him we can
see the beauty of the order of heaven.

The written word which we have,
namely, the Old and New Testament, the
Book of Mormon, and the Book of Doc-
trine and Covenants all agree in testifying
that Jesus is the Christ, but no man can
know this without the testimony of Jesus,
which is the spirit of prophecy. Flesh and
blood did not reveal that fact to Peter, but
the Father who is in heaven. By this power
do we known that Christ lives and is the
Savior of the world, and has commenced
His work in the last days, to gather His
people, redeem and build up Zion, gather
the remnants of Israel, bring the Gentiles
into His covenant who will receive the
gospel, restore the Jews to their land, and
establish the New and Everlasting
covenant, which He established with the
fathers and ratified to the children. We are
in this work; and we are called to be faith-
ful and to sanctify ourselves as a people and
prepare for the coming of the Son of Man.
May God help us to do so. Amen.
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