
selves this question and reflect upon the 
objects sought to be obtained by those who 
are arrayed against us. We do not seek the 
destruction of any, we have never been ag-
gressive, we have never sought to force our 
opinions upon anyone; we have invited all 
to come to this land and proclaim their 
principles here, without let or hindrance. 
They have not been gagged in their faith, 
or restrained or restricted in any manner. 
They have had the privilege of preaching 
to the fullest extent in our tabernacles and 
meetinghouses, and we have not had the 
least objection thereto, but on the contrary 
we have been pleased to see them. This is 
the course we have taken. But when we are 
threatened with destruction, as a pure mat-
ter of self-defense it is our duty to organize 
ourselves to resist these attacks, and the 
people who would not do it are unworthy 
of an existence upon the earth. I, there-
fore, have ever been, am now, and will al-
ways be, while I feel as I do at the present 
time, in favor of greater union among this 
people, in favor of the United Order, in fa-
vor of everything that will give us strength 
and cement us closer and closer together 
and make our lines more impregnable 
than they are. And as I said the other day 
so say I again, with the help of God, my 
life shall be devoted to that object with all 
the strength, influence and ability which 
God shall give me among this people. Is 
there any harm in this? Not in the least, so 
long as our objects are what they are. We 
want to save, we want to preserve, we want 
to disseminate good principles, and any 
man or woman who will practice this can 
live forever in the midst of the Latter-day 
Saints and never have any difficulty. Every 
fair-minded man who comes to this land 
and deports himself as a gentleman, and

any fair-minded lady who comes and de-
ports herself in like manner, might live 
here until they were as old as Methuselah 
was, if we continued as we have been, 
without ever having the least cause of feel-
ing against us. We ask no more from others 
than we are willing to extend to them with 
the greatest liberality and freedom; but 
we expect to have liberty and freedom for 
ourselves, and we shall contend for them 
in every constitutional and legal manner as 
long as we live.

My brethren and sisters, if you have not 
got this spirit of union let me advise you to 
seek for it. Humble yourselves before God 
and seek for it until the desire to be more 
closely united will burn within you, until 
you regard it as one of the greatest objects 
that can be attained. In a family capacity, 
in a ward capacity, or as a people, from 
north to south, we should not have these 
clashing and conflicting interests—Latter-
day Saints against Latter-day Saints, and 
yet all of us professing to have the build-
ing up of God’s kingdom at heart. I do not 
know of anything else that we have to do. 
God has sent us here for this object, and 
I do not know any better thing that we 
can engage in than to build up the Zion 
of God. It is as good and as great a labor 
as we can be engaged in, in fact it is the 
labor which God has assigned unto us as a 
people and as individuals, and if any of us 
are engaged in anything else we are not in 
the line of our duty, and we should turn 
aside from that and pursue the path which 
God has marked out.

May God bless you and fill you with 
his Holy Spirit, that you may carry it with 
you to your various homes in the remote 
parts of the Territory, and that it may live  
and burn within you, fill you with good
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