
to these matters, it is through the revela-
tions of God, and we say to God be the 
glory and not to us. They went forth in 
former times and preached the Gospel 
without purse and scrip. We have done the 
same. I can see around me scores and hun-
dreds of men who have been abroad to the 
nations of the earth to preach the Gospel 
without purse and scrip, trusting in the liv-
ing God, holding the same Priesthood and 
authority; in possession of the same truths, 
lit up, encouraged, and sustained by the 
same Spirit, the same light, and the same 
intelligence that they had.

These are some of the distinctive fea-
tures of the Church of Jesus Christ of 
Latter-day Saints. Then we have gathered 
ourselves together. Well, the Prophets 
saw it years and years ago, and proph-
esied about it, but it was left for us to 
do. The Prophet says—“I will take one 
of a city, and two of a family, and I will 
bring them to Zion.” What will you do 
with them? “I will give them pastors after 
my own heart, who shall feed them with 
knowledge and understanding.” I will in-
troduce the Priesthood of the Son of God 
among them; I will give them the light, 
revelation and power of God to be with 
them, and I will stand by them and sus-
tain them. He has revealed to us, as he 
did to others, the nature of the relation-
ship that subsists between men and their 
wives; he has shown us that there are 
eternal associations and connections, and 
has shown us how to accomplish these 
objects, and to secure to ourselves, our  
wives and our children, inasmuch as they 
observe the revelations of God and car-
ry out his purposes. These are some of 
the principles that he has made known 
unto us, and he has given us command- 
ments relative to these things, and in rela-
tion to building Temples to his name and

administering therein, so as to be accept-
able to him. He has pointed out to us cer-
tain principles pertaining to the everlast-
ing covenants with us, with our fathers 
and with our children, and has shown us 
how to perform the various duties devolv-
ing upon us, according to the counsel of 
his will, which he has revealed through the 
holy Priesthood that he has here upon the 
earth. These are things with which we are 
most of us familiar, and therefore I do not 
propose to quote Scripture about them 
particularly, but just lay them briefly be-
fore your minds, that you may reflect upon 
them.

Before we came into this Church and 
kingdom, we had certain confused ideas 
about a future state; but what did we know 
about it? Very little, very little indeed. We 
hoped we should get to heaven when we 
died; we hoped that, if we were good, hon-
est, upright and virtuous, God would ac-
cept us, which was all very good so far as it 
went. But what knowledge had we of the 
future? None at all. What knowledge has 
the world today about these things? None 
at all. What knowledge have they of us and 
of our communications with God? None 
at all. The world never saw the kingdom 
of God, they never can see it, it is out of 
their reach. Jesus said in his day—“Except 
a man is born again, he cannot see the 
kingdom of God,” much less inherit it. 
They cannot help that; we could not help 
it when we were in their condition; gen-
erations past could not help it. What could 
they do about it? Nothing. What could any 
of the great reformers, as they are called, do 
about these things? Simply nothing. Did 
any of them ever introduce the Gospel as 
Jesus taught it? Not one among them; with  
all their virtue, zeal and philanthropy,
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