
him and that surrounded the Church, and 
the labors that were so essential for him 
to perform, we can now understand why 
it was that he was so greatly strengthened, 
that he had such vigor not only in speak-
ing, but in performing the labors of trav-
eling and visiting the various settlements, 
that he enjoyed. I do not believe myself 
that President Young could have felt as 
happy, as I know he does feel, had he left 
the Church in the condition it was in when 
he commenced his labors last spring. I am 
convinced that it has added greatly to his 
satisfaction; it has been a fitting consum-
mation to the labors of his long life that he 
should be spared to organize the Church 
throughout these valleys in the manner in 
which it now is organized. It was remarked 
by brother Pratt, in his discourse, that at 
no time since the first organization of the 
Church have the Latter-day Saints been 
so well organized; everything set in order 
so completely as we now see them. This is 
his experience and his testimony; and you 
know he has been familiar with the Church 
from nearly the first of its organization to 
the present time. And I believe this would 
be the testimony of every man of years be-
longing to the Church. And I am thankful 
this day that President Young was spared to 
accomplish this work, that the Lord gave 
him the bodily vigor and the mental capac-
ity sufficient to enable him to close up the 
labors of his earthly career in so fitting a 
manner.

He has marked out the path for the 
Twelve to pursue. And I was a number of 
times impressed during the summer that 
the spirit he possessed in relation to these 
matters impelled him to hurry them up, 
and have everything attended to quick-
ly; almost a feeling of restlessness was  
manifested by him (which was so con-

trary to his usual calmness of manner), to 
have the work of organization completed. 
I have been reminded a number of times 
of the same spirit that rested upon the 
Prophet Joseph; he seemingly could not 
rest, he was constantly stirring up and urg-
ing the Twelve to step forward and assume 
the responsibility that lay upon them, and 
to impart to the people the knowledge that 
the Lord had given to him, and to bestow 
upon the servants of God the keys and 
the authority of the holy Priesthood in its 
fulness. And President Young manifested 
the same spirit. He lived to receive Elder 
Taylor and the brethren of the Twelve who 
accompanied him after their return from 
organizing the last of the Stakes of Zion, 
and to confer with them. In a few hours 
afterwards he took his exit.

At no time probably in the history of 
the Church have the Saints been so calm 
and so serene, manifesting so little concern 
in relation to the way matters should go, 
and the affairs of the Church be conduct-
ed, as they have on this occasion. It has 
seemed as though the Lord has prepared 
the people for these things. He has poured 
out upon us the spirit of union that has 
not been enjoyed, probably, to so great an 
extent at any time in our history. There are 
great labors assigned to all of us in every 
department of the Priesthood. If we take 
up the work and carry it forward in the 
spirit with which it has been committed to 
us by him, now that he has gone from our 
midst, the Lord will continue to be with 
us, and to bless us as he did him. For He 
was with him all his life; He was with him 
in counseling the people; He was with him 
in prophesying to the people, and in teach-
ing them and directing them in their tem-
poral as well as their spiritual labors. And
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