
you confine marriage to one man and one 
woman there will necessarily be a share of 
the women who cannot be married; that 
is, if the sexes are equal in numbers. Then 
I can do as I please. I know the confiding 
nature of woman; I know how she loves, 
how she clings to the object of her love. 
This will be my opportunity.” But what 
shall be said respecting the women. The 
men so far as they are concerned, have the 
right to marry or not as they please. But 
here is a large percentage of the women 
who by this law are to a certain extent de-
prived from marrying, even supposing the 
sexes to be equal. A civil commotion arises. 
Men go to war, they go to sea, they engage 
in commercial pursuits, they leave their 
homes, they engage in hazardous occupa-
tions. The result is that though in the be-
ginning the men and women were equal in 
numbers, by the effects of war, and of en-
gaging in hazardous pursuits which women 
do not follow, the men die and are killed, 
and the women survive and outnumber the 
males. The operation of a law then, such 
as I have described, increases the hardship, 
increases the percentage of those who are 
not married and who have no opportunity 
of marrying. Here comes along a man after 
witnessing the evils that have grown up 
among his brothers and sisters, and says, 
“I have a plan to suggest which I believe 
will cure the evils that exist among us. I 
see that a dreadful vice called prostitution 
has crept into our midst, and arising from  
it are dreadful diseases, diseases that I can-
not describe, so appalling are they that  
the very thought of them makes the heart 
recoil with horror; they have appeared  
in our family circle and they are destroy- 
ing our young men and women. And

now then, the plan that I have to propose 
to our family is this, that every man shall 
marry until all the women are married, un-
til every woman that wants a husband shall 
have one, so that the men who will not 
marry shall not have a class of unmarried 
women, to prey upon, to commit violence 
with, or to prostitute. Now,” says he, “if 
you let all these men and women marry, 
there will be some women who will not 
want to marry, but that proportion will be 
very small; and by this means you will ar-
rest this dreadful evil that is growing in our 
midst.”

Now let me put this to you; let us rea-
son upon this, face to face, as I have said. 
Which will be the better plan? According 
to my judgment, speaking as one of this 
family, not as a member of Congress, not 
as a “Mormon” but as one of the family I 
have described. The latter law is far supe-
rior to the other. I would say, as a father, 
if I had a family of that kind, by all means 
let my daughters marry, let every woman 
have a husband that wants one. Then if 
every man marries a wife, they will only 
have a wife apiece; but if there should be 
any of the boys that do not want wives, the 
girls would not necessarily go without hus-
bands.

I consider our false tradition upon this 
subject one of the greatest evils at the 
present time that exists upon the earth. 
It has come down to us from the Greeks 
and Romans, than whom a more abomi-
nable lot of people never lived upon the 
earth. To read their books is enough to 
make a man with the least feeling of mod-
esty blush and be ashamed of his race. Yet 
they are introduced into our literature. 
Whoever reads Horace, Sallust, and num-
bers of those authors, well knows how full 
of corruption they are. Not only crimes,
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