
In rising to address the congregation 
this afternoon, a brief passage of Scripture 
is suggested to my mind, as the basis for 
such remarks as I may make. It is the latter 
part of the seventh verse of the fourteenth 
chapter of the Book of Revelation, and 
reads as follows: “and worship him that 
made heaven, and earth, and the sea, and 
the fountains of waters.” Believing with 
the ancient Apostles “that no prophecy of 
scripture is of any private interpretation; 
but holy men of God spoke as they were 
moved by the Holy Ghost,” and that “all 
scriptures were written for our profit and 
learning that we through faith in them, 
might have hope.” I am firmly convinced 
that the words of the text have a profound 
significance; for although it is acknowl-
edged that the sacred writings contain  
the most sublime language, and furnish  
the most poetic quotations, still I do not 
believe that those holy men sought to 
round off their sentences, simply for the 
sake of the music they would afford to  
the ear of the reader; but that beneath all 
the poetry and sublimity of the language, 
there is a beautiful meaning to every sen-

tence recorded, involving the most im-
portant truths for the benefit of mankind. 
In order to reach clearly the correct sig-
nificance of the passage we have read, let 
us first consider by whom it was uttered, 
and inquire into the circumstances under 
which it was recorded. History tells us that 
the venerable Apostle John who wrote the 
Book of Revelation, was sentenced by the 
Emperor Domitian of the Roman Empire, 
to be scalded to death in a cauldron of 
boiling oil; that this cruel sentence was car-
ried out as fully as it was in the power of 
men to execute it. The cauldron of oil was 
heated to boiling heat, and the great apostle 
was submerged in the scalding fluid, but 
through Divine interposition he was deliv-
ered like Daniel from the “lion’s den,” and 
Shadrach, Meshach and Abednego from 
the “fiery furnace,” by the power of that 
God, whom he served and obeyed; so that 
he suffered no harm and simply looked like 
he had been anointed. The cruel Emperor  
was so enraged at this wonderful deliv-
erance, that he instantly sentenced the 
doomed Apostle to banishment on the  
Isle of Patmos. While in exile in accor-

JOURNAL OF DISCOURSES206

z
FATES OF THE ANCIENT APOSTLES—WORSHIP OF THE TRUE 

GOD—HIS CREATIONS AND HANDIWORK—PROPHECY

DISCOURSE BY ELDER CHARLES W. STAYNER, DELIVERED IN THE TABERNACLE,  

SALT LAKE CITY,  SUNDAY AFTERNOON, MAY 25,  1879

Reported by Geo.  F.  Gibbs

JOD Vol 20-LIVE.indd   206JOD Vol 20-LIVE.indd   206 5/16/20   9:17 PM5/16/20   9:17 PM


