
the universe. But who or what that power 
and intelligence is, they do not compre-
hend, neither can they without he should 
reveal himself unto them. But when the in-
quiry arises as to who is this organizer the 
voice of the angels comes ringing down the 
cycle of time, “Worship God, who made 
the heavens,” for, as the Psalmist gives it, 
“The heavens declare the glory of God; 
and the firmament showeth his handi-
work.” How charming it is to contemplate 
the beauty of the heavens, and then think 
of the discoveries that have been made; 
concerning light, for instance. How won-
derful it is! To think that light, traveling, as 
scientists assert, from the sun to the earth 
in eleven minutes, a distance that would 
occupy a cannon ball twenty-five years in 
transit; and yet, notwithstanding its ve-
locity, it is so composed as not to harm in 
the least degree the tenderest of animal or 
vegetable substances; the minutest plant—
the most delicate flower is blessed by its 
influence, and not in the least injured by 
the rapidity of its motion. How is this ac-
complished? By the particles of which it is 
composed being so minute as not to offer 
any resistance to the slightest substance. 
And yet a single sunbeam, which no one 
can paint or define, looking so innocent 
and colorless, is found to consist of seven 
colors, and will penetrate the deepest dark-
ness and reveal all existing objects in their 
proper and actual form and color. The 
beneficial effects of the sun’s light cannot 
be too highly appreciated, and, in contem-
plating its blessings we are constrained to 
“worship God who made the heavens.” 
Let us now consider the earth; take for  
instance the atmosphere which we  
breathe and by which we are sustained. We

find it in a pure condition originally, but 
we ascertain that it is rendered impure by 
being breathed. Through passing through 
the lungs it becomes so highly carbonized 
that it is unfit for our use; the large infu-
sion of carbonic dioxide it receives through 
the process of respiration, renders it poi-
sonous to men and animals; but strange to 
say it is then in the most proper condition 
to nourish the life of the vegetable king-
dom. Plants thrive on it, and vegetation 
generally, receives its chief nutriment from 
that impurity which animals could not 
endure. Scientific experiment has proved 
that a sprig of mint placed in a bottle of 
air rendered impure by respiration or pu-
trefaction, will so absorb the impurity, 
and nourish itself on the unwholesome 
carbonic acid gas, as to again render the 
air sufficiently pure to sustain human and 
animal life. Thus we find that the atmo-
sphere which would otherwise become un-
fit to sustain our lives, is purified, and at 
the same time is enriching us through the 
medium of the vegetable creation, from 
which we derive much of our support and 
sustenance.

Then think of the richness of our fields, 
of the mineral wealth in these huge moun-
tains, of the beauties to be seen and stud-
ied in the floral creation, of the grandeur 
of earth’s scenery, and the capacity of 
the soil to support its wonderful popula-
tion, think of what is on the earth’s sur-
face, and consider what is discovered in 
its deepest recesses; and when the inquiry 
arises as to the originator of these bless-
ings, and men of science and reflection 
ask who and what is the controlling power 
that bestows and regulates all these things, 
the loud voice of the angel comes down 
through the ages, “Worship God who 
made the earth!” Then there is the mighty
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