
spirit that you heard Brother Pratt talk 
about this morning. It became necessary 
also that a medium should be introduced 
whereby man might be placed in commu-
nion with God, that they might compre-
hend him, that they might understand his 
laws when he gave them, that they might 
be acquainted with the principles which 
he had to develop; for there is one great 
principle that men very little understand, 
viz.: “The things of God knoweth no 
man, but the Spirit of God,” and if they 
don’t know only through his wisdom, it 
would be in vain for God to communi-
cate with a people who could not com-
prehend him, who had not the capacity 
to receive these principles which he had 
to communicate. The same principle 
holds good everywhere among all the 
principles with which we are acquainted 
or know anything about. You cannot 
teach a child algebra, nor arithmetic, un-
til it has gone through a certain system of 
training. You cannot teach the arts and 
sciences without necessary preparation 
for their introduction, nor can you teach 
people in the government of God with-
out they are placed in communication 
with him, and hence comes the Church 
of God, and what is meant by that? A 
school, if you please, wherein men are 
taught certain principles, wherein we can 
receive a certain spirit through obedience 
to certain ordinances. And we, having re-
ceived this spirit through those ordinan-
ces, were then prepared to take the ini-
tiatory steps in relation to other matters, 
and hence as a commencement the Lord 
appeared unto Joseph Smith, both the 
Father and the Son, the Father point-
ing to the Son said, “This is My Beloved 
Son in whom I am well pleased. Hear ye 
Him!” Here, then, was a communica-
tion from the heavens made known unto

man on the earth, and he at that time 
came into possession of a fact that no 
man knew in the world but he, and that 
is that God lived, for he had seen him, 
and that his Son Jesus Christ lived, for 
he also had seen him. What next? Now 
says the Father, “This is My Beloved 
Son. Hear him!” The manner, the mode, 
the why, and the wherefore, he designed 
to introduce through him were not ex-
plained; but he, the Son of God, the 
Savior of the world, the Redeemer of 
man, he was the one pointed out to be 
the guide, the director, the instructor, 
and the leader in the development of the 
great principles of that kingdom and that 
government which he then commenced 
to institute. What next? The next step 
was that men having held the priesthood, 
that had ministered in time and eternity 
and that held the keys of the priesthood 
came and conferred them upon Joseph 
Smith. John the Baptist conferred upon 
him the Aaronic priesthood, and Peter, 
James and John the Melchizedek priest-
hood; and then others who had oper-
ated in the various ages of the world, 
such as Moses and Enoch, appeared 
and conferred upon him the authority 
that they held pertaining to these mat-
ters. Why? Because it was “the dispen-
sation of the fullness of times,” not of 
one time only but of all the times; it was 
the initiatory step for the development 
of all the principles that ever existed, or 
would exist pertaining to this world, or 
the world to come. What next? He was  
commanded to set apart other men, to 
baptize them that believed, that had faith 
in God and in his kingdom, and in his 
revelations and in his government. After 
they were put in possession of these prin-
ciples, they were commanded to baptize 
those who believed on the Lord Jesus
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