
as a part of the human family, that some 
among us will be more or less affected 
by this spirit. Now, we ought to get this 
idea clearly upon our minds and upon the 
minds of our children. We ought to under-
stand the necessity of yielding obedience to 
proper laws. We ought to learn to under-
stand the laws that pertain to our bodies 
so that they may be kept healthy. And we 
should become fully acquainted with the 
laws that govern our Church. Every prin-
ciple that God has revealed should be clear 
to our minds, and in order to understand 
them we should read the books given to us, 
the Bible, the Book of Mormon, and the 
Book of Doctrine and Covenants. These 
ought to direct us in our everyday lives. 
Then when we come to meeting and hear 
our brethren speak the word of the Lord, 
we should try to treasure up in our hearts 
the words of life, put them into practice, 
and also teach the same to our children; for 
it is on this principle that we will become 
prepared to go into the presence of God 
by and by, and not merely because we are 
called Saints, not merely because we have 
been ordained to some office in the priest-
hood, not merely because we may have 
been put into some position to preside or 
direct our fellows. This will not exalt us, 
but the practice of what is right and true 
will exalt us. In fact every person in do-
ing what is good and right is naturally 
bettered thereby, and every individual in 
doing what is evil is degraded thereby. All 
our acts are known by the powers on high 
whom we cannot see. They understand 
us, although we may think no one sees 
what we do. Yet though no one should 
see us, if no one but ourselves knows our 
acts, if we do what is evil and debasing

we are that much the worse for it; if we do 
that which is right and good we are that 
much the better for it. And if we practice 
righteousness and teach men, so we will 
become great in the kingdom of heaven on 
natural principles.

We should all live according to the 
laws of God, to the best of our ability—al-
though we are beset with many weaknesses 
and infirmities and faults, many of which 
have been transmitted to us from our fore-
fathers away back for ages and are concen-
trated in us who live in the latter days. But 
so far as we have power and ability, we are 
required to battle with and overcome our 
inherent failings, and if we take hold of 
the principles of righteousness, in the very 
act of doing that we are bettered, and if we 
continue in this path we will go on from 
grace to grace, from light to light, from 
purity to purity, from holiness to holi-
ness, “Till we all come in the unity of the 
faith, and of the knowledge of the Son of 
God, unto a perfect man, unto the mea-
sure of the stature of the fulness of Christ.” 
We must be clothed with his light, and be 
filled with his fullness, and be fit to stand 
in his presence and dwell with the Father. 
And this is the promise: “To him that 
overcometh will I grant to sit with me in 
my throne, even as I overcame, and am set 
down with my Father in his throne.” There 
is no need for us at anytime to be in the 
dark concerning our duties. We need not 
be in the dark concerning any act we desire 
to perform, if we will go to the Father and 
say, “Father, make thy will known to me. 
Enable me to walk in thy light to do that 
which is pleasing to thee; enable me to over-
come all that is contrary to thy law.” If we 
live in this kind of spirit, there will always
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