
to them—the aborigines of this continent, 
called the American Indians, but really 
the descendants of Jacob. We have given 
unto us within the lids of this book (Book 
of Mormon) the fullness of the everlast-
ing Gospel. We have the principles of the 
Gospel laid down in their simplicity—
plainer by far than in the Bible, though 
agreeing with that sacred record. It is in re-
ality the stick of Judah that is contained in 
the Bible; the stick of Ephraim is contained 
in the Book of Mormon. Isaiah prophesied 
concerning the coming forth of this book. 
In fact the writings of the Prophets are 
pregnant with predictions concerning the 
establishment of the Kingdom of God in 
the latter days.

Joseph Smith declared that John the 
Baptist came and restored the Aaronic 
Priesthood, and also that Peter, James 
and John restored the Apostleship, and 
the keys and powers thereof. Please tell 
me who it was that put it into the heart 
of this so called impostor (Joseph Smith) 
regarding the coming forth of this book? 
Will you please tell me where he ac-
quired the wisdom to concoct such a re-
cord? Who taught Joseph Smith the ne-
cessity of the Aaronic and Melchizedek 
Priesthoods? Who taught Joseph Smith 
the perfect system of the organization 
of the Church of Jesus Christ of Latter-
day Saints? Who taught him the neces-
sity of three High Priests presiding over 
the Church of Christ like unto Peter, 
James and John? Who taught him the 
necessity of the Quorum of the Twelve 
Apostles, and of their powers and duties 
and the presidency thereof? Who taught 
him the necessity of the High Priest- 
hood in their presidings? Who taught  
him the necessity of the Seventies and

their organization? Who taught him the 
necessity of the Elders’ Quorum, the 
Priests’ Quorum, the Teachers’ Quorum, 
and the Deacons’ Quorum? Who taught 
him the organization of the Stakes of Zion 
with their presidency, their High Council, 
their Bishops, Teachers, etc? Who taught 
him the necessity of baptism by immersion 
for the remission of sins, and the laying 
on of hands for the reception of the Holy 
Ghost? Who taught him the necessity of 
holding keys of Priesthood, and that God 
would reveal principles through this chan-
nel that had been hidden from before the 
foundation of the world? Who taught him 
of the pre-existence of the spirit of man? 
Who taught him the philosophy of our 
probation upon the earth, and the results 
that would flow from a faithful obser-
vance of the principles of righteousness? 
He declared that Jesus Christ taught him; 
he declared that all these things were re-
ceived through the revelations of the Lord 
Jesus Christ to him. When people say that 
Joseph Smith was an impostor, they make 
him one of the greatest men that ever lived 
in view of the religion he founded. Again, 
who taught him the necessity of marriage 
for eternity? Who taught him the doctrine 
of baptism for the dead? Who taught him 
the principles of the resurrection and eter-
nal judgment, as described in this Book of 
Doctrine and Covenants? I answer, God 
the Eternal Father.

Now, will you please tell me why the 
world are so embittered against us as 
a people? I will tell you. It is upon the 
same principle that they were embittered 
against the Messiah. The Messiah came 
with His bowels filled with compassion 
and love for the human family. He taught 
them how to be saved to the uttermost.
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